


So when the woman saw that the 
tree was good for food, and that it 
was a delight to the eyes, and that the 
tree was to be desired to make one 
wise, she took of its fruit and ate, and 
she also gave some to her husband 
who was with her, and he ate.

Genesis 3:6



Then the eyes of both were opened, 
and they knew that they were naked. 
And they sewed fig leaves together 
and made themselves loincloths.

Genesis 3:7



And they heard the sound of the Lord 
God walking in the garden in the cool 
of the day, and the man and his wife 
hid themselves from the presence of 
the Lord God among the trees of the 
garden. 

Genesis 3:8



 But the Lord God called to the man 
and said to him, “Where are 
you?” And he said, “I heard the sound 
of you in the garden, and I was afraid, 
because I was naked, and I hid 
myself.”

Genesis 3:9-10



He said, “Who told you that you 
were naked? Have you eaten of the 
tree of which I commanded you not 
to eat?”

Genesis 3:11



But when one turns to the Lord, the 
veil is removed. Now the Lord is the 
Spirit, and where the Spirit of the 
Lord is, there is freedom.

2 Corinthians 3:16–17



And we all, with unveiled face, 
beholding the glory of the Lord, are 
being transformed into the same 
image from one degree of glory to 
another. For this comes from the 
Lord who is the Spirit.

2 Corinthians 3:18



Therefore, if anyone is in Christ, he is 
a new creation. The old has passed 
away; behold, the new has come.

2 Corinthians 5:17 



I appeal to you therefore, brothers, 
by the mercies of God, to present 
your bodies as a living sacrifice, holy 
and acceptable to God, which is your 
spiritual worship.

Romans 12:1



Do not be conformed to this world, 
but be transformed by the renewal of 
your mind, that by testing you may 
discern what is the will of God, what 
is good and acceptable and perfect. 

Romans 12:2



Now I would remind you, brothers, of 
the gospel I preached to you, which 
you received, in which you stand, and 
by which you are being saved, if you 
hold fast to the word I preached to 
you—unless you believed in vain.

1 Corinthians 15:1–2



For I delivered to you as of first 
importance what I also received: that 
Christ died for our sins in accordance 
with the Scriptures, that he was 
buried, that he was raised on the 
third day in accordance with the 
Scriptures, 

1 Corinthians 15:3-4


